
Sid Meier's Civilization IV Now Shipping To Retail Stores Across North America; All-new Features Include
New Ways to Play and Win, New Tools to Manage and Expand Civilizations, All-new Mod Capabilities and
Intense Multiplayer Modes and Options

October 25, 2005 8:31 AM ET

NEW YORK--(BUSINESS WIRE)--Oct. 25, 2005--2K Games, a publishing label of Take-Two Interactive Software, Inc.
(NASDAQ:TTWO), and FIRAXIS Games, the world renowned video game developer, today announced that Sid Meier's
Civilization IV for the PC has shipped to retail stores in North America. Sid Meier's Civilization IV will be in retail stores
in Europe on November 4.

Sid Meier's Civilization IV comes-to-life like never before in a beautifully detailed, living 3D world that expands the
gameplay experience. This latest installment takes the franchise to new heights with the addition of new ways to play and
win, new tools to manage and expand your civilization, all-new easy to use mod capabilities and various multiplayer
modes and options.

"With more than six million units sold, the Sid Meier's Civilization franchise is recognized as one of the greatest PC game
franchises of all-time," said Christoph Hartmann, Managing Director of 2K Games. "Sid Meier's Civilization IV expands
on the popular gameplay in the Civilization series with new features including religion, some of history's most influential
people and for the first time in the Civilization series, a full 3D engine."

"The Civilization series is very close to our hearts," said Jeff Briggs, Founder, President and CEO of FIRAXIS Games.
"We've worked diligently to make Civilization IV even better than its worthy predecessors, and are really proud of the end
result."

"Each new Civilization is a major undertaking," added Sid Meier, Director of Creative Development at FIRAXIS Games.
"Creating Civilization IV was a monumental task, but everyone at FIRAXIS was determined to create the best Civ
experience yet, and I think we succeeded. Fans will absolutely love this game and folks new to the series won't be able to
resist."

    Key Features:


    --  Faster-Paced Fun - Gameplay has been streamlined for a

        tighter, faster, and more compelling experience.


    --  Greater Accessibility and Ease of Play - An easy-to-use

        interface will be immediately familiar to RTS and action game

        players, and newcomers to the series will be able to jump in

        and play.


    --  Tech Tree - Flexible Tech tree allows players more strategic

        choices for developing their civilizations along unique paths.


    --  Grow Bigger Empires - More Civilizations, Units, and

        Improvements to enhance and grow your empire.


    --  Multiplayer - LAN, Internet, Play-By-Email, and Hotseat offer

        players all-new strategies and ways to play when competing or

        cooperating with live opponents.


    --  Team Play - Whether playing multiplayer or single player, team

        play offers a new way of setting locked alliances that result

        in shared wonder effects, visibility, unit trading, and shared

        territory that delivers a plethora of new strategic and

        tactical options.


    --  Beautiful 3D world - Sid Meier's Civilization IV comes to life

        with a beautiful 3D world, dozens of fully animated units
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        (including culturally unique units), and totally customizable

        armies. Cities and wonders will appear on the map. Wonder

        movies are back!


    --  Mods and Community Tools - Designed from the ground up for

        modability, the game contains a powerful map editor with XML

        and Python support.


    --  Choose Your Leader - Most Civilizations now have two leaders

        from which to choose, with each Leader having traits that

        provide various bonuses to the player.


    --  Civics - With the discovery of new techs, civic options can

        become available. Freedom of speech or slavery? Hereditary

        rule or open elections? This creates endless government

        choices and possibilities!


    --  Religion - Now there are seven religions in the game that are

        unlocked through researching. When unlocked, the religion

        spreads through a player's empire allowing them to use the

        religion to help manage happiness, gain gold and create Great

        Prophets.


    --  Great People - As the player uses specialists they gain Great

        People points in the city that is utilizing the specialists.

        Great People include the Artist, Tycoon, Prophet, Engineer, &

        Scientist. They can be used to get free techs, start Golden

        Ages, or join a city to increase its output.


    --  Promotions - Each unit has a promotion path that emphasizes

        specific unit traits. Promotions include bonuses to

        Attack/Defend on specific terrains/features, movement bonuses,

        sight/visibility bonuses, and increased withdrawal chances.


    --  In-Game Cinematics - Sid Meier's Civilization IV has over 40

        in-game cinematics.


    Here's what the press is saying about Sid Meier's Civilization IV:


"The only reason to stop playing Civilization IV is to tell other people just how good the game is." - IGN

"This marks a turning point in the franchise that should blow away both new players and long-time fans." -
GameSpy.com

"The PC's most acclaimed strategy franchise returns with a horde of new features to make it easier than ever to shape your
world." - PC Gamer

"Prolific strategy mastermind Sid Meier has yet another opus on the way in the form of Civilization IV." - Game Informer

Sid Meier's Civilization IV is rated E10+ for Everyone ages 10 and older, and will be available in North American retail
stores at a suggested retail price of $49.99. For more information please visit www.CivIV.com or www.firaxis.com.

About Take-Two Interactive Software

Headquartered in New York City, Take-Two Interactive Software, Inc. is an integrated global developer, marketer,
distributor and publisher of interactive entertainment software games and accessories for the PC, PlayStation(R) game
console, PlayStation(R)2 computer entertainment system, PSP(TM) (PlayStation(R)Portable) system, the Xbox(R) video
game and entertainment system from Microsoft, the Xbox 360(TM) video game and entertainment system from
Microsoft, Nintendo GameCube(TM), Nintendo DS(TM) and Game Boy(R) Advance. The Company publishes and
develops products through its wholly owned labels Rockstar Games, 2K Games, 2K Sports and Global Star Software; and
distributes products in North America through its Jack of All Games subsidiary. Take-Two also manufactures and markets
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video game accessories in Europe, North America and the Asia Pacific region through its Joytech subsidiary. The
Company maintains sales and marketing offices in Cincinnati, New York, Toronto, London, Paris, Munich, Madrid,
Vienna, Milan, Sydney, Breda (Netherlands) and Auckland. Take-Two's common stock is publicly traded on NASDAQ
under the symbol TTWO. For more corporate and product information please visit our website at www.take2games.com.

Sid Meier's Civilization, Civilization, and CIV are all registered trademarks of Take-Two Interactive Software, Inc.

About FIRAXIS Games

FIRAXIS Games, founded in 1996 by veteran gaming executive Jeff Briggs, is one of the world's premier independent
game development studios, and home of legendary designer Sid Meier. FIRAXIS has created some of the most successful
and award-winning computer and video games on the market. The company's most recent hit titles include: Sid Meier's
Pirates! (PC and Xbox), the blockbuster Sid Meier's Civilization III series, and Sid Meier's SimGolf. Firaxis legacy titles
include Sid Meier's Civil War Series!, and Sid Meier's Alpha Centauri series. For more information on Firaxis Games visit
www.firaxis.com or contact Kelley Gilmore at kgilmore@firaxis.com.

Sid Meier's Gettysburg, SimGolf, Pirates, and Firaxis are all registered trademarks of Firaxis Games.

Safe Harbor Statement under the Private Securities Reform Act of 1995: This press release contains forward-looking
statements made in reliance upon the safe harbor provisions of Section 27A of the Securities Act of 1933, as amended, and
Section 21E of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, as amended. The statements contained herein which are not historical
facts are considered forward-looking statements under federal securities laws. Such forward-looking statements are based
on the beliefs of our management as well as assumptions made by and information currently available to them. The
Company has no obligation to update such forward-looking statements. Actual results may vary significantly from these
forward-looking statements based on a variety of factors. These important factors are described in the Company's Form
10-Q for the quarter ended July 31, 2005 in the section entitled "Cautionary Statement and Risk Factors".

    CONTACT: 2K Games

             Jason Bergman, 646-723-4203

             jason.bergman@2kgames.com

             or

             B/H Impact

             Derek Musso, 212-689-6360 x 1222

             derek_musso@bhimpact.com

             or

             Take-Two Interactive Software, Inc.

             Jim Ankner, 646-536-3006

             James.anker@take2games.com

             or

             FIRAXIS Games

             Kelley Gilmore, 410-891-3001 ext.131

             kgilmore@firaxis.com


    SOURCE: Take-Two Interactive Software, Inc. and FIRAXIS Games
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